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Introduction: Domestic violence is defined by the World Health Organization (WHO) as the 
intentional use of force or power against another person or against a group of people, resulting 
in injury or harm - being a very present one in our country. In this context, epidemiological 
situations common among most cases can be highlighted, such as the age, ethnicity, and 
schooling of the victim, as well as their relationship with the aggressor and the frequency with 
which the cases of violence occur. Objective: Thus, this study aims to describe the 
characteristics of cases of domestic violence reported in the Information System of Notification 
and Aggravations (SINAN) of Anápolis, between the years 2017 and 2021. Material and 
Methods: The work is configured as an epidemiological, observational, descriptive, cross-
sectional and retrospective study for the analysis of the clinical and epidemiological profile of 
victims of domestic violence by analyzing the compulsory notification forms. Results: Thus, it 
was observed that the profile of the victims in the city of Anápolis (GO), is composed of women 
aged 18 to 29 years (38.0%), brown (69.8%), married or in consensual union (38.9%), with 
incomplete elementary education (27.6%). In most cases the victim was not pregnant (82.5%), 
the aggressor was male (79.3%), and recurrence was present in 46.8% of the cases. The main 
means of aggression is bodily force (68.9%), and its main aggressor a person with whom the 
victim maintains a marital relationship, or ex-marital (46.7%), with the husband being 
responsible for most cases. It is also noted that the years 2020 and 2021 had a lower number 
of cases, showing the influence of the COVID-19 pandemic on the number of notifications, which 
masked the real number of assaults that occurred. Conclusion: Thus, the practice of reporting 
domestic violence cases is an important attitude for improving health care delivery, and can be 
used as a specific health indicator by managers and health professionals.   
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