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Introduction: The Mobile Emergency Care Service (SAMU) is responsible for pre-hospital care, 
working with a qualified multidisciplinary team. There is a higher prevalence of occupational 
stress and, consequently, Burnout Syndrome among these professionals and taking into 
account the pandemic of the new coronavirus, there is a worsening in the mental health of 
these health workers. Objective: To determine the prevalence of occupational stress and 
Burnout Syndrome in prehospital care professionals during the COVID-19 pandemic. 
Methodology: For that, there is a cross-sectional analytical study carried out with the 
multidisciplinary team of SAMU in the city of Anápolis, Goiás, with a population of about 110 
workers. The following validated and pre-tested questionnaires were applied: Cuestionario 
para la Evaluación del Syndrome de Quemarse por el Trabajo (CESQT) and Lipp's Stress 
Symptoms Inventory (ISSL). The results were analyzed using descriptive and analytical 
statistics with a significance level of 95%. Result: Regarding stress in the last month, the 
prevalence was higher among females. In addition, the research showed that there was an 
association between stress in the last month and age group, and regarding marital status, 
there was a relationship with stress in the last three months. Finally, it was possible to observe 
an association between the number of children and stress in the last month. With regard to the 
Burnout Syndrome, there was significance with the variables sex, marital status and role in the 
SAMU. Conclusion: It is concluded, therefore, that occupational stress in the SAMU during the 
pandemic period is related to the sociodemographic profile, function performed and time of 
exercise in the SAMU. Furthermore, related to the prevalence of Burnout Syndrome, an 
association was identified between the sociodemographic profile and the function performed. 
Finally, the importance of this study is emphasized, as this theme is innovative, since few 
researches related to the subject were found. 
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