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ABSTRACT 
 

In Brazil, violence is one of the biggest problems facing the Brazilian population. According to 
UN data from the Secretariat for Human Rights (SDH), approximately one woman every 15 
seconds, an elderly person every 10 minutes, and 18,000 children a day are victims of some 
type of violence in the country. In the first half of 2018, according to federal government data, 
Ligue 180 recorded 27 femicides, 51 homicides, 547 attempted femicides, and 118 attempted 
murders. Of the reports that arrived, 37,396 were of physical violence, and 26,527 were of 
psychological violence. According to a 2019 study by Instituto Locomotiva and Instituto Patrícia 
Galvão, 97% of Brazilian women have already suffered some type of harassment in public and 
private transport in Brazil. In view of this, it is proposed to map, and inform legal determinations 
of distance from the aggressor to victims of domestic violence and denounce possible violations 
of these determinations, tracing a profile of the aggressor, publicizing his conduct before the 
determinations and thus strengthening legal compliance and safety of the victim. By creating a 
means of disclosing legal documents, where companies and public and private institutions can 
carry out research that facilitates the recognition of individuals who have enacted protective 
measures and thus avoid the occurrence of future cases in the professional environment and 
strengthen the security of women. During the project development process, agile methodologies 
were used to approach concepts of Scrum, Design Sprint, and Lean Inception. Weekly idea 
brainstorming was conducted to discover new requirements for the product. The development 
of the system took place throughout the week, with deliveries and validations based on timelines 
defined weekly. The results obtained were the development of artifacts such as a project 
overview document, activity backlog, design, and user experience plan (persona, user journey 
development, and prototyping) software architecture plan, integration plan continuous, 
verification and validation, as well as database modeling and definition. The objective is to create 
web software to help disseminate and monitor protective measures using the multidisciplinary 
concepts taught in software engineering bachelor's degree for creating artifacts, project 
management, and communication. 
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